
SPECIALISTS IN PERIODONTAL MEDICINE AND IMPLANT DENTISTRY

PUGET SOUND PERIO

We are open Monday through Friday with clinic hours (day dependent) from 7am to 4pm

Hello, my name is Dr. Thomas Kang. I 
am pleased to introduce myself and our 
team of caring doctors. Dr. Kevin 
Suzuki, Dr. Allen Liu, Dr. Jessica Hsu, 
Dr. Jenna Cha, Dr. Gretchen Stern and 
Dr. Ehsan Zahedi and I would like to 
welcome you to our periodontal 
specialty practice. We have three 
convenient locations to serve you. Your 
dentist has determined that you may 
benefit from the care of a periodontist, 
and I would like to offer our expert 
hands, compassionate, caring staff, and 
world class facilities for your treatment 
consideration. 

We are all considered experts in the  
fields of Periodontal Medicine and 
Implant Dentistry. As local study club 
mentors and nationally recognized 
speakers, we bring to the Pacific 
Northwest a truly expert team for 
patients in need of conservative gum 
disease treatment, augmentation of 
gums affected with recession, and 
replacement of missing teeth with 
dental implants. 

We are strong believers in 
multidisciplinary care and work only 
with those select dentists that we feel 

share our high standards for patient 
care. Integrity, honesty, and 
compassionate care are the hallmarks of 
our practice. Our tenured staff 
understands the role that they play in 
improving our patients lives as they go 
through periodontal and dental implant 
treatments. Our warm, family-like 
atmosphere is felt by each of our 
patients, and we recognize that we must 
be the “A TEAM” for our referring 
office to ensure a seamless and 
consistently excellent patient experience. 

What to Expect at Your First Visit: 

A thorough evaluation of your 
periodontal condition will be completed 
at your first visit. This may include full 
mouth probing of your gum pockets, 
assessment of gum recession or X-rays 
as needed, to supplement what your 
dentist has already sent us or 3D dental 
CT scans to assess your candidacy for 
dental implant placement. 

In most cases, a treatment plan 
following your evaluation will be 
presented to you with detailed 
information about fees associated with 
care, as well as what your dental 
insurance coverage may be. A follow up 

Please take a photo of your referral slip 
(back of this page).

Use the camera on your phone to 
request an appointment, where you can 
upload the photo of the referral slip.

If it is easier you can also call the 
location most convenient to you above.

Federal Way
P. (206) 400-0800
F. (253) 874-9068

2505 S. 320th St. #330
Federal Way, WA 98003

West Seattle
P. (206) 519-5337
F. (206) 260-2712

2743 California Ave SW #200
(West) Seattle, WA 98116

Request Appointment New Patient Forms

Scan here to request your appointment Scan here to complete your registration

Eastlake
P. (206) 329-0410
F. (206) 260-2712

2731 Eastlake Avenue East
Seattle, WA 98102

meeting is required if the doctor 
requires a consultation with your 
physician or dentist prior to providing 
you with an appropriate treatment plan. 

Before Your Visit:

Please visit us at pugetsoundperio.com/
newpatientforms or scan the QR code 
below to fill out your new patient forms. 
If you do not have access to a computer, 
please arrive 20 minutes before your 
scheduled visit to fill out these forms. 

The easiest and best way to schedule 
your initial visit is by filling out a new 
patient appointment request at 
www.pugetsoundperio.com or scan the 
QR code below.

 If you have received a treatment plan 
from your referring office or are seeing 
us for a second opinion, please bring 
that treatment plan with you to assist in 
your treatment planning in our office.

Office Locations



SPECIALISTS IN PERIODONTAL MEDICINE AND IMPLANT DENTISTRY

PUGET SOUND PERIO

Federal Way West Seattle Eastlake
First Available
Dr. Kang
Dr. Suzuki
Dr. Cha
Dr. Stern
Dr. Zahedi

Comprehensive Exam (Multiple Sites)

Pain? Swelling?

Areas of Concern:

Radiography:

Implant Sites: ___________________

Medical Concerns: _________________________________
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For implant cases please specify preference for open or closed tray impression coping.

Implants

Yes

X-ray sent to appointments@pugetsoundperio.com X-rays Needed

CBCT 3D X-rays May be Required ($179 fee)

No

Recession Crown Lengthening Tooth Removal

Open Closed

Limited Exam

Patient Name: _ _____________________________________________  Today’s Date: ___________________
	 Last	  First	  M.I.

Primary Phone: _ __________________________   Email: _ _________________________________________

Requesting Doctor’s Name: _________________________________  Phone: _ __________________________

First Available
Dr. Kang
Dr. Liu
Dr. Hsu
Dr. Cha
Dr. Stern
Dr. Zahedi

First Available
Dr. Suzuki
Dr. Liu
Dr. Zahedi


